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 Vietnam Financial Select Sector Index (VNFINSELECT) 

 Vietnam Diamond Index (VNDIAMOND) 

 

Ngày chốt số liệu  30/09/2021 ; Ngày công bố 18/10/2021  

Ngày hoàn thành tái cơ cấu danh mục 01/11/2021 

 

 Vietnam Financial Select Sector Index (VNFINSELECT) 

Thêm:  ACB, VIB, MSB, LPB, TVS, VDS, APG. 

Loại:  Không loại cổ phiếu nào. 

 

 Vietnam Diamond Index (VNDIAMOND) 

Thêm:  OCB vì đáp ứng đủ điều kiện. 

Loại:  LPB tỷ lệ FOLs dưới 85% 

Danh mục và tỷ lệ dự báo  

Mã 
Tỷ trọng 

mới 

Tỷ trọng 

cũ 

Thay đổi 

% 

Giá trị 

mua/bán (trđ) 

Khối lượng 

mua/bán (CP) 

FPT 15.00% 16.07% -1.07% (131,347) (1,426,136) 

MWG 15.00% 17.18% -2.18% (267,604) (2,123,845) 

PNJ 14.05% 10.61% 3.44% 422,192 4,639,475 

TCB 8.46% 8.19% 0.27% 32,637 659,335 

VPB 7.88% 8.86% -0.98% (120,769) (1,802,526) 

ACB 5.70% 5.70% 0.00% (211) (6,703) 

GMD 5.40% 5.91% -0.51% (62,830) (1,319,964) 

MBB 4.76% 5.13% -0.37% (44,881) (1,602,909) 

REE 3.90% 5.51% -1.61% (197,695) (3,188,631) 

NLG 3.79% 5.00% -1.21% (148,553) (3,623,256) 

VIB 3.06% 0.95% 2.11% 259,149 7,099,972 

MSB 2.39% 1.91% 0.48% 58,989 1,999,612 

CTG 2.23% 2.22% 0.01% 1,366 44,071 

TPB 2.14% 2.24% -0.10% (12,087) (302,180) 

EIB 1.84% 0.63% 1.21% 148,582 6,242,956 

TCM 1.78% 0.25% 1.53% 187,430 2,861,525 

OCB 1.54% 0.00% 1.54% 189,112 7,962,591 

CTD 1.09% 1.57% -0.48% (59,376) (892,867) 

LPB 0.00% 1.83% -1.83% (224,640) (10,187,777) 
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Appendix A: Important Disclosures 

Analyst Certification 

Each research analyst primarily responsible for the content of this research report, in whole or in part, certifies 
that with respect to each security or issuer that the analyst covered in this report: (1) all of the views 
expressed accurately reflect his or her personal views about those securities or issuers; and (2) no part of his 
or her compensation was, is, or will be, directly or indirectly, related to the specific recommendations or views 
expressed by that research analyst in the research report. 

Ratings Definitions 

BUY: We have a positive outlook on the stock based on our expected absolute or relative return over the 
investment period. Our thesis is based on our analysis of the company’s outlook, financial performance, 
catalysts, valuation and risk profile.  We recommend investors add to their position. 

HOLD-Outperform: In our view, the stock’s fundamentals are relatively more attractive than peers at the 
current price. Our thesis is based on our analysis of the company’s outlook, financial performance, catalysts, 
valuation and risk profile.  

HOLD-Underperform: In our view, the stock’s fundamentals are relatively less attractive than peers at the 
current price.  Our thesis is based on our analysis of the company’s outlook, financial performance, catalysts, 
valuation and risk profile.  

SELL: We have a negative outlook on the stock based on our expected absolute or relative return over the 
investment period. Our thesis is based on our analysis of the company’s outlook, financial performance, 
catalysts, valuation and risk profile.  We recommend investors reduce their position. 

Under Review: We actively follow the company, although our estimates, rating and target price are under 
review. 

Restricted: The rating and target price have been suspended temporarily to comply with applicable 
regulations and/or Yuanta policies. 

 

Note: Yuanta research coverage with a Target Price is based on an investment period of 12 months.  
Greater China Discovery Series coverage does not have a formal 12-month Target Price and the 
recommendation is based on an investment period specified by the analyst in the report. 

 

Global Disclaimer 

© 2018 Yuanta. All rights reserved. The information in this report has been compiled from sources we believe 
to be reliable, but we do not hold ourselves responsible for its completeness or accuracy. It is not an offer to 
sell or solicitation of an offer to buy any securities. All opinions and estimates included in this report constitute 
our judgment as of this date and are subject to change without notice.  

 

This report provides general information only. Neither the information nor any opinion expressed herein 
constitutes an offer or invitation to make an offer to buy or sell securities or other investments. This material is 
prepared for general circulation to clients and is not intended to provide tailored investment advice and does 
not take into account the individual financial situation and objectives of any specific person who may receive 
this report. Investors should seek financial advice regarding the appropriateness of investing in any securities, 
investments or investment strategies discussed or recommended in this report. The information contained in 
this report has been compiled from sources believed to be reliable but no representation or warranty, express 
or implied, is made as to its accuracy, completeness or correctness. This report is not (and should not be 
construed as) a solicitation to act as securities broker or dealer in any jurisdiction by any person or company 
that is not legally permitted to carry on such business in that jurisdiction.  

 

Yuanta research is distributed in the United States only to Major U.S. Institutional Investors (as defined in 
Rule 15a-6 under the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, as amended and SEC staff interpretations thereof).  
All transactions by a US person in the securities mentioned in this report must be effected through a 
registered broker-dealer under Section 15 of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, as amended. Yuanta 
research is distributed in Taiwan by Yuanta Securities Investment Consulting. Yuanta research is distributed 
in Hong Kong by Yuanta Securities (Hong Kong) Co. Limited, which is licensed in Hong Kong by the 
Securities and Futures Commission for regulated activities, including Type 4 regulated activity (advising on 
securities). In Hong Kong, this research report may not be redistributed, retransmitted or disclosed, in whole 
or in part or and any form or manner, without the express written  

 

 

 


